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Board of Education 
Nutley, New Jersey 

April 28, 1986 

The Regular Meeting of the Board of Education of the 
Township of Nutley, New Jersey, was held in the Board Room, 
375 Bloomfield Avenue, on Monday, April 28, 1986, at 9:00 p.m., 
with Mr. Charles W. Kucinski, Jr., President, presiding. 

FLAG SALUTE: 

The meeting was opened with Mr. Rusignuolo leading the 
Board members and citizens in the Pledge of Allegiance to the 
American flag. 

CALL OF ROLL: 

12. 

The other members present at roll call were: Dr. Anthony 
N. Baratta, Mr. Sam Battaglia, Mr, Frank V. Hermo, Mr. Joseph L. 
Malanga, Mr. Charles J. Piro, Mr. Gerard T, Restaino, Mr. Robert J. 
Rusignuolo, and Mrs. Rosalie C, Scheckel. Nine citizens were 
present. 

COMMUNICATIONS: 

None 

SECRETARY'S REPORT: 

In the absence of Mr. Ramsland, Mrs. Simons presented and 
read the following report: 

''My sincere congratulations to Mr. Restaino, Mr. Piro, 
and Mr, Hermo on their re-election to the Board of Education for 
another three-year term, This victory was no less notable because 
of the lack of serious opposition, for I perceive that instead of 
'selling' yourselves in a two-month campaign, you demonstrated 
your leadership qualities over the entire term which you have 
tonight just completed. No one, not even Mr. DeCroce, who attracted 
a creditable vote, came forward to say 'I can do it better.' 

"I would also like to recognize with sincere gratitude all 
the fine Nutley citizens who gave willingly of their time and talent 
to run the election on April 15, It has often been noted that 
Nutley is a unique town. Nowhere is this quality exemplified more 
clearly than in the volunteer spirit of its citizens. Other muni­
cipalities must hire and pay poll workers. Ours do it out of a 
sincere concern for our school system. Many thanks to one and all. 
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"Finally, I would like to express my deep appreciation to all 
the members of my staff who worked diligently behind the scenes on 
the budget material and the election preparations. I'm tempted to 
wonder whether my absence was a liability or an asset. 

"In the maintenance department, the following projects have 
been completed during the past month: 

Glass Replacement 15 
Other Carpentry and General 54 
Plumbing and Heating 36 

"Fire drills held during the months of March and April were 
as follows: 

Mar. 24 Washington School 10 :05 a.m. 1 min. 35 secs. 
Mar. 26 Franklin School 10:00 a.m. 2 min. 2 secs. 
Mar. 26 Lincoln School 2:05 p.m. 1 min. 3 secs. 
Mar. 27 Franklin School 10 :00 a.m. 2 min. 
Mar. 31 Radcliffe School 10:52 a.m. 1 min. 17 secs. 
Apr. 1 Franklin School 9:30 a.m. 1 min. 52 secs. 
Apr. 1 Lincoln School 10: 10 a. m. 1 min. 3 secs. 
Apr. 2 Spring Garden School 8:50 a. m. 1 min. 22 secs. 
Apr. 4 Nutley High School 11:55 a. m. 2 min. 47 secs. 
Apr. 7 Washington School 1:35 p .m. 1 min. 27 secs. 
Apr. 9 Washington School 11 :15 a. m. 1 min. 32 secs. 
Apr. 14 Radcliffe School 2:10 p.m. 1 min. 15 secs. 

FINANCIAL REPORT: 

Mrs. Simons presented the financial report as of March 31, 
1986, showing total funds available of $16,320,273.03, contractual 
orders to date of $12,478,000.45, leaving a cash balance of 
$3,842,272.58. 

REPORT OF THE TREASURER OF SCHOOL MONEYS: 

II 

Mrs. Simons presented the Report of the Treasurer of School 
Moneys as of March 31, 1986, showing total receipts of $12,779,058.41, 
cash expenditures of $11,785,482.61, leaving a cash balance of 
$993,575.80. 

SUPERINTENDENT'S REPORT: 

Dr. Fadule presented and read the following report: 

"Please note the following important dates: 

Kindergarten screening - week of May 5 

Lincoln School P.T.A. Musicale, May 8, 7:30 p.m. 
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Jun.ior Olympics, May 12 

DisU ict Writing Test, May 14 and 15 

franklin School P.T.A. Musicale, May 15, 7:30 p.m. 

Yantacaw School P.T.A. Musicale, May 21, 7:30 p.m. 

Nutley High School Fine & Industrial Arts Festival, 
May 22, 9:00 a.m, - 3:00 p.m. 

5:45 p.m. - 7:45 p.m. 

14. 

Nutley High School Spring Music Festival, May 22, 8:00 p.m. 

Radcliffe School P.T.A. Musicale, May 27, 7:30 p.m. 

Washington School P,T.A. Musicale, May 28, 7:30 p.m. 

Nutley High School Activities & Athletic Awards Program, 
May 28, 7:30 p.m. 

Spring Garden School P.T.A. Musicale, May 29, 7:30 p.m. 

"Attached is the March 31st student enrollment chart." 

CAFETERIA REPORT: 

Mr. Hermo presented the cafeteria report as of March 31, 
1986, showing a cash balance as of July 1, 1985 of $1,588.95, total 
receipts of $201,798.76, total disbursements of $196,646.50, leaving 
a balance of $6,741.21. Total "A" lunch - 11,577. Total milk sold -
13, 891. 

Mr. Kucinski made reference to an article which appeared in 
the April, 1986 issue of the Americal School Board Journal entitled 
"Here's How One School Sent Math Scores Soaring" which was written 
about the Nutley schools, adding that this is an outstanding credit 
to the Nutley School System. 

Dr. Fadule stated that the Board of Education has been very 
supportive as has the vast majority of parents. He added that the 
principals and teachers have worked very hard to accomplish these 
results, and this article fostered a feeling of professional pride. 

REPORTS OF COMMITTEES: 

None 

HEARING OF CITIZENS: 

Mrs. Joan Rubino asked for clarification on two items which 
appeared on the Bill List, to which Mr. Decesare and Dr. Fadule responded. 
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Mrs. Rubino questioned the purpose of the Test '~ommittee. 
Mr. Decesare informed her that the Test Committee met to review the 
Nutley Achievement Test because it is revised slightly each year. 

Mrs. Rubino asked what the Promotion Requirements Committee 
did, to which Mr. DeCesare replied that as a result of this Committee, 
Franklin School has a report ready to present to the Board with 
recommendations. 

Mrs. Rubino then questioned what was involved in the Nursery 
School Articulation Meeting. Mr. Decesare responded that because 
of the change in the kindergarten entry date, a meeting was held 
with representatives from the nursery schools to review what is done 
in kindergarten, what the curriculum is, and how the nursery schools 

.can better prepare the children for entry into kindergarten. 

Mrs. Rubino inquired about the Chemistry for Children Work­
shop, to which Mr. Decesare replied that this would fit into the 
gifted category and it is chemistry related. 

Mrs. Rubino then asked about the HSPT Workshop. Mr. DeCesare 
replied that the purpose of this was to analyze results of the test 
and see what we have to concentrate on to improve. 

BILLS AND MANDATORY PAYMENTS: 

Mr. Herma presented and moved 
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta. 
lution was unanimously adopted: 

the adoption of the following 
On a roll call vote the reso-

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education authorizes 
the payment of bills and mandatory payments in the total 
amount of $1,380,327.78 as per the attached Schedule A 
which have been audited by the Business Department, 

REQUESTS FOR USE OF SCHOOL BUILDINGS AND GROUNDS: 

Mr. Herma presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel, and unanimously approved by 
the Board: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education approves 
the requests for the use of school buildings and grounds 
(Schedule B), provided they conform to the rules and 
regulations set by the Board of Education. 

RETIREMENT - Teacher: Mr. Maurice Bright 

Mr. Piro presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mr. Malanga, and unanimously approved by 
the Board: 
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BE IT"RESOLVED; That the retirement of Mr, Maurice 
Bright, high school foreign language teacher, be 
accepted effective July 1, 1986. 

RETIREMENT - Guidance Counselor: Mrs. Helen Clement 

Mr. Piro presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta, and unanimously approved by 
the Board: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the retirement of Mrs. Helen 
Clement, Nutley High School guidance counselor, be 
accepted effective July 1, 1986. 

RETIREMENT - Cafeteria: Mrs. Betty Dippel 

16. 

Mr. Battaglia presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel, and unanimously approved by the 
Board: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the retirement of Mrs. Betty 
Dippel, Franklin School cafeteria employee, be accepted, 
effective July 1, 1986. 

RETIREMENT - Custoqian: ~rs. Theresia Len'yuk 

Mr. Battaglia presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta, and unanimously approved by the 
Board: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the retirement of Mrs. Theresia 
Lenyuk, Franklin School custodian, be accepted, 
effective July 1, 1986. 

RETIREMENT - Custodian: Mr. Vincent Peluso 

Mr. Battaglia presented and moved the adoption of" the following 
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel, and unanimously approved by the 
Board: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the retirement of Mr. Vincent 
Peluso, Nutley High School custodian, be accepted, 
effective July 5, 1986. 

LEAVE OF ABSENCE - Teacher: Mrs. Carol Bender 

Mr. Restaino presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel, and unanimously approved by 
the Board: 



17. 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education approve a 
childrearing leave of absence for Mrs. Carol Bender, 
elementary school music teacher, effective May 6, 1986 
through June 30, 1986. 

RESIGNATION - Teacher: Mrs. Nancy Foglio 

Mr. Restaino presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mr. Malanga, and unanimously approved by 
the Board: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the resignation of Mrs. Nancy 
Foglio, Franklin School mathematics teacher, be accepted, 
effective June 30, 1986·. 

RESIGNATION - Permanent Substitute: Miss Lauren Andrade 

Mr. Restaino presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel, and unanimously approved by 
the Board: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the resignation of Miss Lauren 
Andrade, high school permanent substitute, be accepted, 
effective April 18, 1986. 

RESIGNATION - Cafeteria: Mrs. Mary Zack 

Mrs. Scheckel presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta, and unanimously approved by the 
Board: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the resignation of Mrs. Mary Zack, 
Franklin School cafeteria worker, be accepted effective 
March 14, 1986. 

APPOINTMENT - Buildings and 
Grounds Employee: 

Mr, Lawrence Koster 

Mrs. Scheckel presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo. On a roll call vote the reso­
lution was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education approve the 
appointment of Mr. Lawrence Koster to the buildings and 
grounds department, effective April 14, 1986 through 
June 30, 1986, at the salary of $14,236 (2-3), in accord­
ance with the 1985/1986 custodian salary guide. 
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APPOINTMENT - Permanent Substitute: Mrs. Susan McKay 

Mrs. Scheckel presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta. On a roll call vote the resolu­
tion was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education approve the 
appointment of Mrs. Susan McKay as a high school permanent 
substitute, effective April 8, 1986 at the rate of $45 
per day and fringe benefits which include Blue Cross-
B1ue Shield and dental plans. 

APPOINTMENTS - Teacher Substitutes: 

Mr. Rusignuolo presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta. On a roll call vote the resolu­
tion was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the teacher substitutes listed on 
the attached Schedule C be approved for the 1985/1986 
school year. 

APPOINTMENT - Custodial Substitute: 

Mr. Rusignuolo presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel. On a roll call vote the resolu­
tion was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That Miss Joanne Follet be approved as 
custodial substitute for the 1985/1986 school year. 

APPOINTMENT - Substitute Bus Aide: Mrs. Barbara Tagliareni 

Dr. Baratta presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mr. Malanga. On a roll call vote the reso­
lution was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That Mrs. Barbara Tagliareni be approved 
as substitute bus aide for the 1985/1986 school year. 

EXTRA COMPENSATION - Workshops, Committees: 

Dr. Baratta presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel. On a roll call vote the reso­
lution was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the following personnel be paid 
extra compensation in the amounts indicated for services 
performed in curriculum development: 
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English I Committee - March 1, 15, 1986 

Mrs. Loretta Taylor 

Test 

Mrs. Susan Ames 
Mr. John Ryan 
Mrs. Noreen Mickey 
Ms. Carol Shepherd 

Total 

Committee - March 1, 1986 

Mrs. Kathleen Serafino 
Miss Rose DiGeronimo 
Mrs. Margaret Murray 
Mrs. Ellen Young 
Mrs. Dorothy Mutch 
Mrs. Judith Hubert 
Mrs. Rosemarie Baranko 
Mrs. B. Santoriella 
Mrs, Justina Bruno 
Miss Deborah Pinto 

Total 

Writing Committee - March 1, 15, 

Helen ·Poole 
Patricia Adubato 
Dianne DeRosa 
Loretta Douglas 
Linda Fisher 
Kathy Gennarelli 
Linda Gilroy 
Patricia Griffin 
Gerri Intiso 
Honor James 
Jan Jelenski 
Kathy Kinney 
Paul Kocurn 
Mari K. Konn 
Janet Langston 
Anne Starace 
Ro Tangorra 
Mary Williams 
Judy Hardin 
Yvonne Migliaccio 
Gertrude Frey 
Nancy Lee.· 

Total 

1986 

$200.00 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 

$765.12 

$100.00 
100.00 

70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 

$765.12 

$188.32 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 
141. 28 
141.28 
141. 28 

70.64 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 

70.64 
141.28 
141. 28 
141,28 
141.28 

70.64 
70.64 

$2,872.64 
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Computer Network Committee - March 15, 1986 

Mrs. Kathleen Serafino 
Mrs. Jean Tennis 
Mr. Steve Parigi 
Mrs. Amy Menendez 
Mrs. Denise Vill'Neuve 

Total 

$100.00 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 

$382.56 

Non-Academic, Business Education - March 15, 1986 

Mr. Ronald Barker 
Mrs. Mary Jane Emde 
Mr. Edward Fraser 
Mr. James Mauro 
Mr. Thomas Mccrohan 

Total 

$100.00 
70.64 

100.00 
70.64 
70.64 

$411.92 

Social Studies Committee - March 15, 1986 

Dr. Charles Fuccello 
Mr. Raymond Chapman 

Total 

$ 75.00 
52.98 

$127.98 

Promotion Requirements - March 15, 22, 1986 

Mr. Paul Primamore 
Mr, William Shergalis 
Diane Zuccaro 
Neli Santiago 
Robert Ash 
Cathy Kinney 
Patricia Arant 
Maria Lopa 
Diane Williams 
Margaret Murray 
Carol Ann Harris 
Phyllis Walsh 

Total 

$200.00 
100.00 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 
141.28 

70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 

$1,430.24 

20. 

Nursery School Articulation Meeting - March 22, 1986 

Miss Barbara Hirsch 
Mrs. Kathleen Serafino 
Miss Rose DiGeronimo 
Mr. Alex Conrad 
Mr. John Walker 
Marie Bigley 

$ 50.00 
50.00 
50.00 
50. 00 
50.00 
35.32 
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Nursery School Articulation Meeting - March 22, 1986 (cont'd.) 

Patricia Adubato 
Vicki Latka 
Gilda Schwartz 
Donna Cerniglia 
Grayce Berk 

Total 

$ 35.32 
35.32 
35.32 
35.32 
35.32 

$461. 92 

Chemistry for Children Workshop - March 22, 1986 

Doreen Holland 
Gail Reilly 
Elizabeth Foot 
Lind a G i1 roy 
Mari Konn 
Joyce Loeffler 
Amy Menendez 
Dolores Nahirny 
Anita Pondiscio 
Debbie Schop 
Arlene Nardiello 
Gerri Intiso 
Camille Lofrano 
Pam Tsairis 
Jean Tennis 
Grace Mccaw 

Total 

HSPT Workshop - April 5, 1986 

Mr. Paul Primamore 
Justina Bruno 
Loretta Douglas 
Judy Hardin 
Cathy Kinney 
Paul Kocum 
Jacqui Meloni 
Dorothy Mutch 
Rae Nardone 
Carol Shepherd 
Arleen Wellman 
William Shergalis 

Total 

Writing Conferencing Workshop 

Miss Helen Poole 
Susan Ames 
Ronald Bonadonna 

$ 70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 

$1,130.24 

$100.00 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 

100.00 

$906.40 

April 12, 1986 

$ 94.16 
70.64 
70.64 
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Writing Conferencing Workshop - April 12, 1986 (cont'd.) 

Suzanne Bruno 
Dianne DeRosa 
Mary Anne Diorgi 
Loretta Douglas 
Linda Fisher 
Gertrude Frey 
Nicoletta Graziano 
Thomasina Hyland 
Noreen Mickey 
Yvonne Migliaccio 
John Ryan 
Elizabeth Stolfi 
Loretta Taylor 

Total 

Grand Total 

SUMMER EMPLOYMENT - Special Education 
Work Study Coordinator: . 

$ 70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 
70.64 

100. 00 

. $1,183.12 

$10,437.26 

Mr. Thomas Cusick 

Dr. Baratta presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo. On a roll call vote the reso­
lution was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education authorize two 
weeks of summer employment for Mr. Thomas Cusick, Special 
Education Work Study Coordinator, the exact dates of which 
must be approved by the Director of Special Services or 
any other designate named by the Superintendent of Schools. 

SUMMER SCHOOL APPROVAL: 

Mr. Herma presented and moved the adoption of the following 
reso-lution, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo, and unanimously approved by 
the Board: 

WHEREAS, the State Department of Education requires an 
approval by the Board of Education for summer sessions, and 

WHEREAS, the summer session operated by the Nutley 
Board of Education meets the requirements for State 
approval, 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, That the Superintendent 
of Schools make application to the County Superintendent 
of Schools with a request for approval from the State 
Department of Education. 
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SPECIAL CLASS PLACEMENTS - Atypical Students: 

Mr. Herma presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo. On a roll call vote the 
resolution was unanimously adopted: 

School 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education authorizes 
the attendance of additional Nutley students at Special 
Education classes for the 1985/1986 school year as follows: 

Effective 
No. of Students Classification Date Tuition 

Williams Sthool Emotionally (prorated) 
New Milford, NJ 1 Disturbed 4/9/86 $2,762 

Essex Valley H.S. Emotionally (prorated) 
Montclair, NJ 1 Disturbed 4/14/86 $10,000 

Calais School Emotionally (prorated) 
Whippany, NJ 1 Disturbed 4/28/86 $10,000 

RENEWAL OF COOPERATIVE BID: 

Mr. Malanga presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mr. Battaglia. On a roll call vote the reso­
lution was unanimously adopted: 

WHEREAS, NJSA 18A:18A-42h provides for the yearly renewal, 
for a period not exceeding three years, without further 
solicitation of bids, of contracts for the supplying of 
"materials, supplies or services that are required on a 
recurring basis from year to year" and 

WHEREAS, the Board finds that the fuel oil supplied by 
National Terminal Inc., the low bidder for the 1984/1985 
school year, continues to meet the original specifications, 

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, That the Nutley Board of Education 
authorizes the Montclair Board of Education to renew, on its 
behalf, the contract with National Terminal Inc. of Newark, 
New Jersey for furnishing #4 fuel oil and burner service to 
the Nutley School System for the 1986/1987 school year at the 
same Margin and Service charge as for the 1984/1985 and 1985/ 
1986 school years. 

NOTE: The districts in the cooperative are Montclair, Nutley, 
Bloomfield and Belleville, and the Town of Montclair. The 
bids received for the 1984/1985 school year are tabulated 
below: 



I"'"-:.-~ 
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-. I 

Posted 
Bidder Grade Price 

Dean 2 .8700 
4 ,8150 

Eastern 2 . 8700 
4 .8150 

Lionetti 2 . 8700 
4 .8150 

National 2 . 8700 
4 .8150 

Pierson 2 .8700 
4 

Ultramar 2 
4 .8150 

RENEWAL OF ICE CREAM BID: 

Bid 
Margin Price 

+.0187 .8887 
+.0170 .8320 

+.0126 .8826 
- .0115 .8035 

+.0353 .9053 
+.0238 .8388 

- . 0100 .8600 
-.0150 .8000 

+.0159 .8859 
NO BID 

NO BID 
+.0156 .8306 

Service 

No Bid 
No Bid 

N/C 
N/C 

.0130 

.0200 

.0050 

.0025 

.0049 

NO BID 

24. 

Total 
Price 

.8826 

.8035 

.9183 

.8588 

.8650 

.8025 

.8908 

Mr. Malanga presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta. Upon being put to a roll call 
vote the resolution was adopted with Dr. Baratta, Mr. Herma, Mr. Malanga, 
Mr. Piro, Mr. Restaino, Mr. Rusignuolo, Mrs. Scheckel and Mr. Kucinski 
voting aye and Mr. Battaglia voting nay: 

WHEREAS, NJSA 18A:18A-42h provides for the yearly renewal, 
for a period not exceeding three years, without further 
solicitation of bids, of contracts for the supplying of 
"materials, supplies or services that are required on a 
recurring basis from year to year" and 

WHEREAS, the Board finds that the ice cream supplied by 
Amy Gail Ice Cream Co., the sole bidder for the 1984/1985 
school year, continues to meet the original specifications, 

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, That t e Nutley Board of Education 
renews the contract with Amy Gail Ice Cream Co. of Newark, 
New Jersey for furnishing ice cream to the Nutley School 
System for the 1986/1987 school year at prices as follows: 

Ice Cream Sandwiches 
Vanilla Popsicles 
Small Dixie Cups 
Assorted Popsicles 
Ice Cream Cones 
Fudge Popsicles 
Juice Bars 

Price Per Dozen 

$2.19 
2.00 
2.06 
2.33 
2.64 
2.01 
9.84 (price per box of 72) 

NOTE: This represents a price increase of 2.5% over the 
1985/1986 school year. 
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RENEWAL OF MILK AND DAIRY PRODUCTS BID: 

Mr. Malanga presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mr. Battaglia. On a roll call vote the reso­
lution was unanimously adopted: 

WHEREAS, NJSA 18A:18A-42h provides for the yearly renewal, 
for a period not exceeding three years, without further 
solicitation of bids, of contracts for the supplying of 
"materials, supplies, or services that are required on a 
recurring basis from year to year" and 

WHEREAS, the Board finds that the milk and dairy products 
supplied by DeGraaf Dairies, Inc., the low bidder for the 
1985/1986 school year, continues to meet the original 
specifications, 

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, That the Nutley Board of Educa­
tion renews the contract with DeGraaf Dairies, Inc. of 
Clifton, New Jersey, for furnishing milk and dairy products 
to the Nutley School System for the 1986/1987 school year 
at prices as follows: 

1 pts. milk white homogenized .0695 margin 2 
1 pts. milk chocolate .0790 margin 2 
1 pts. milk skimmed .0595 margin 2 
·1 pts. milk lo fat chocolate .0695 margin 2 
1 
2 pts. orange juice .225 
3 lb. loaves cream cheese 4.95 
5 lb. tub cottage cheese 4.95 
1 qt. milk - white homogenized .344 margin 
1 gal. milk - white homogenized .544 margin 2 

NOTE: This represents an average price increase of 2.5% 
over the 1985/1986 school year. 

NON-RENEWAL OF TEACHING CONTRACTS: 

Mr. Hermo presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mr. Malanga. On a roll call vote the reso­
lution was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the contracts of the following non­
tenure teachers not be renewed for the 1986/1987 school 
year: 

Mrs. Stephanie Arena 
Mrs. Lisa Berg 
Mr. Joseph Bertuzzi 
Mrs. Donna Butler 
Mrs. Donna Cerniglia 
Miss Ellen Ciccone 

Mrs. Barbara Longo 
Mr. Dominick LoPresti 
Mr. Mark Maniscalco 
Mrs. Beverly Masullo 
Miss Marita McDermott 
Mrs. Amy Menendez 

I 

. I 
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Mrs. Mary Ann Diorgi 
Miss Maria DiPaolo 
Mrs. Janet Gerba 
Mr. Frank Giovannucci 
Mr. Daniel Greco 
Mr. Thomas Hill 
Mr. Richard Koegel 
Mr. James Landy 
Miss Vicki Latka 
Miss Paula Lee 
Mr. John Lindley 

Chapter 1/S.C.E. 

Mrs. Mary Appel 
Mrs. Anne Bevere 
Mrs. Suzanne Bruno 
Mrs. Gail Kahn 
Mrs. Dianna Rimshnick 

Miss Janet Nyblade 
Mrs. Marietta O'Brien 
Mrs. Donna Patti-Milbank 
Mrs. Mary Rubino 
Miss Mary Frances Simmons 
Miss Julie Stabile 
Mr. William Stivale 
Mrs. Alice Terry 
Miss Sharon Unglaub 
Mrs. Jeanne Urbano 

NON-RENEWAL OF CONTRACTS - Instructional Aides: 

26. 

Mr. Hermo presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel. On a roll call vote the reso­
lution was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the contracts of the following 
instructional aides not be renewed for the 1986/1987 
school year: 

Mrs. Suzzanne Fochesato 
Mrs. Josephine Martino 
Mrs. Audrey Paolino 
Mrs. Christine Pecora 
Mrs. Alma Pope 

SOCIAL STUDIES DErARTMENT STAFF REDUCTION: 

Mr. Hermo presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel. On a roll call vote the reso­
lution was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That in light of declining enrollment 
in social studies classes at Nutley High School the 
number of Social Studies positions at the high school 
be reduced by one, and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That this action will require 
the displacement of the least senior tenured faculty 
member in the Social Studies Department. 
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GERMAN STUDIES DEPARTMENT STAFF REDUCTION: 

Mr. Hermo presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo. On a roll call vote the 
resolution was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That in light of declining enrollment 
in German language classes at Nutley High School, the 
position of the German language teacher at the high 
school be reduced to a part-time position. 

APPOINTMENT - Buildings and Grounds 
Employee: 

Mr. Richard Peacher 

Mr. Hermo presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel. On a roll call vote the 
resolution was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education approve the 
appointment of Mr. Richard Peacher to the buildings and 
grounds department, effective April 28, 1986 through 
June 30, 1986, at the salary of $14,236 (2-3), in accord­
ance with the 198·5/1986 custodian salary guide. 

APPOINTMENT - Instrumental Music 
Teacher/Band Director: 

Mr. Peter D'Angelo 

Mr. Hermo presented and moved the adoption of the following 
resolution, seconded by Mr. Malanga. On a roll call vote the reso­
lution was unanimously adopted: 

BE IT RESOLVED, That Mr. Peter D'Angelo be appointed 
from July 1, 1986 through June 30, 1987 as an instru­
mental music instructor on Step 18, M:A.+ 30, of the 
1986/1987 teachers' salary guide, and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That Mr. Peter D'Angelo be 
appointed as director of the high school band for the 
1986/1987 school_ year on the band director salary 
guide. 

OLD BUSINESS: 

None 

NEW BUSINESS: 

None 



,__.. 
, I 

ADJOURNMENT: 

There being no further business to come before the Board, 
on motion made by Mr. Battaglia, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo, the 
meeting was adjourned at 9:45 p.m. 

({ilw~~ 
President 

28. 


