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Board of Education May 21, 1984
Nutley, New Jersey

The Regular Meeting of the Board of Education of the
Township of Nutley, New Jersey, was held in the Board Room,
375 Bloomfield Avenue, on Monday, May 21, 1984, at 8:00 p.m.,
with Mr. Gerard T. Restaino, President, presiding.

FLAG SALUTE:

The meeting was opened with Mrs. Scheckel leading the
Board members and citizens in the Pledge of Allegiance to the
American flag.

CALL OF ROLL:

The other members present at roll call were: Dr. Anthony
N. Baratta, Mr. Sam Battaglia, Mr. Frank V. Hermo, Mr. Charles W.
Kuecinski, Jr., Mr. Joseph Malanga, Mr. Charles J. Piro, Mr. Robert
J. Rusignuolo, and Mrs. Rosalie C. Scheckel. Approximately 25
citizens were present.

APPROVAL OF MINUTES:

Copies of the minutes of the Regular Meeting held on
April 16, 1984, at 8:15 p.m., being in the hands of each member,
reading of same was dispensed. Mr. Kucinski moved that the minutes
be approved, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo and unanimously approved by
the Board.

COMMUNICATIONS:

Mr. Ramsland presented and read the following communications:

1. A letter from John Walker, Principal, Yantacaw School:

'"On behalf of the Yantacaw School students, parents and staff,
I would like to thank you for the expediency extended in
restoring our building following the December fire.

"During our recent spring concert and open house, we received
many favorable comments from parents with regard to the resto-
rations.

"The painting of the classrooms, other than those affected by
the fire, has further enhanced the condition of the building
as a whole.

"Thank you for your concern.'

L
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2. A letter from Donald Politi, President, Radcliffe School P.T.A.:

"On behalf of the Executive Board of the Radcliffe P.T.A. thank
you for attending the P.T.A. meeting on May 18. Please extend
our appreciation to Mr. Malanga, Mr. Kucinski and Mr. Piro for
attending also.

'"As we discussed at the meeting, the Radcliffe parents have
several concerns about the proposed move of the three large buses
to Radcliffe. Our major concerns are the safety of the children
and fumes from the buses near the classrooms. We believe many
of the concerns voiced by the members in attendance are valid
concerns and we request you convey them to the members of the
board of education.

"The Radcliffe School P;T.A. is opposed to the proposal of parking
the three large buses at Radcliffe and request that alternative
plans be made.

"Thank you for your consideration in this matter."

SECRETARY'S REPORT:

Mr. Ramsland presented and read the following report:

"The plans for the refreshment stand and rest room facility at
the Park Oval have been submitted to the Township Code Enforcement Office.
This procedure is new. Legislation which became effective on April 17,
1984 provides that plans not requiring review for educational adequacy
be submitted to the local municipal construction enforcing agency. The
target date for receipt of bids is June 15.

""Something about warmer Spring weather causes school windows to
break. Our maintenance department replaced 34 this past month. Last
month it was 30, and in March it was 20. Additionally, 28 items of
carpentry and general maintenance were completed, as were 19 plumbing
and heating repairs.

"Fire drills held during the months of April and May were as

follows:

April 12 Franklin School 2:00 p.m. 1 min. 37 secs.
April 13 Nutley High School 12:17 p.m. 2 min.

April 17 Radcliffe School 2:07 p.m. 1 min. 13 secs.
April 19 Spring Garden School 12:50 p.m. 1 min. 21 secs.
April 19 Washington School - 10:40 a.m. 1 min. 26 secs.
April 30 Franklin School 9:35 a.m. 1 min. 57 secs.
April 30 Yantacaw School 10:20 a.m. 1 min. 45 secs.
April 30 Yantacaw School 1:50 p.m. 1 min. 32 secs.
May 7 Lincoln School 2:05 p.m. 1 min. 9 secs.
May 7 Nutley High School 8:40 a.m. 2 min. 15 secs.
May 7 Spring Garden School 2:04 p.m. 1 min. 19 secs.
May 9 Radcliffe School 2:30 p.m. 1 min. 15 secs.
May 9 Washington School 2:20 p.m. 1 min. 15 secs.
May 21 Radcliffe School 9:12 a.m. 1 min. 14 secs."
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FINANCIAL REPORT:

e e Tt e TR e e S BT R L M T ARED e S, __ ‘j-/é//rf/_ :

Mr. Ramsland presented the financial report as of April 30,
1984, showing total funds available of $15,996,616.84, contractual
orders to date of $14,332,607.77, leaving a balance of funds
available of $1,664,009.07.

SUPERINTENDENT 'S REPORT :

Dr. Fadule presented and read the following report:

"Please keep in mind the following graduation dates:

June 20 High School - 6:30 p.m.
June 14  Special Education - Lincoln 10:00 a.m.
June 18 Lincoln School 1:15 p.m.
June 19 Washington School 2:00 p.m.
June 20 Franklin School 10:00 a.m.
June 20 Spring Garden School 2:00 p.m.
June 21  Radcliffe School 1:15 p.m.
June 21 Yantacaw School 2:00 p.m.

"The Central Office has received the 1983/1984 Minimum
Basic Skills and Iowa test results. A presentation will be made
in the near future."

Dr. Fadule requested that the Board approve an Administrative
Day for teachers and administrators on Thursday, June 21, 1984. The
youngsters would not attend school that day. Mr. DeCesare then
explained what would take place on the Administrative Day.

Mr. Kucinski moved that the Administrative Day be approved

for this year, seconded by Mr. Malanga, and unanimously approved by
the Board.

CAFETERIA REPORT:

Mr. Kucinski presented the cafeteria report as of April 30,
1984, showing a cash balance as of July 1, 1983 of $327.78, total
receipts of $226,867.53, total disbursements of $210,480.26, leaving
a balance of $16,715.05. Total "A" lunch - 12,648. Total milk sold -
11, 660.

REPORTS OF COMMITTEES:

Mr. Malanga, Chairman of the Athletic Committee, reported
that the Committee had met on May 17. Mr. Malanga announced that
the Belleville-Nutley football game would be played on Thanksgiving
Day this year. He added that there was some concern with regard to
when the Passaic-Nutley game would be played. It had been scheduled
for October 6 which is a Jewish holiday, and Passaic is unable to
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play on that date. It is now tentatively scheduled for Monday afternoon,
October 8, Columbus Day, but Mr. Malanga stressed that the date is not
definite at this point.

Mr. Malanga reported that the athletic director had requested
the Committee to consider hiring an athletic trainer, but the Committee
would like to see a job description, and this item will be brought back
to the Athletic Committee for further discussion.

The Athletic Committee felt that new wrestling mats should be
purchased for the high school gym because of a safety factor.

Dr. Baratta, Chairman of the Personnel Committee, stated that
the Committee had also met on May 17, and two items were on the agenda.
They discussed short and long range plans with regard to the projected
declining enrollments, but there is no recommendation at this time.
Several personnel items were reviewed, and one of the items appears
on tonight's agenda.

HEARING OF CITIZENS:

Mr. Michael Duffy, 272 Kingsland Street, expressed his dismay at
the possibility of a reduction in staff in the arts programs in Nutley.
Dr. Fadule replied that any decisions would be fiscally responsible and
educationally sound. He reiterated that he considers the music program
a very important one.

Mr. Mario DiMaggio, 749 Centre Street, asked questions with regard .
to the $63,000 listed in the Capital Outlay account which is slated to be

. used for the proposed refreshment stand and rest room facility at the Park’

Oval, to which Mr. Ramsland replied. Mr. DiMaggio then questioned if there
are any plans to upgrade the Radcliffe School playground, to which

Mr. Ramsland replied that a considerable amount of work will be done

there this summer.

Mrs. Pat Lepore, 41 Howard Place, questioned what kinds of summer
school programs were available for students, to which Dr. Fadule replied
that for grades 7 - 12, summer school is for credit for courses which
students had failed. There is a summer enrichment program for grades 1 -
6 and sometimes grades 7 and 8 for youngsters who are trying to improve
themselves. This program is not graded. Mrs. Lepore asked if there is
a summer program for the Vector children, to which Dr. Fadule replied
in the negative.

BILLS AND MANDATORY PAYMENTS:

Mr. Kucinski presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta. On a roll call vote the resolution
was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education authorizes the
payment of bills and mandatory payments in the total amount
of $1,738,945.89 as per the attached Schedule A which have

been audited by the Business Department.
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REQUESTS FOR USE OF SCHOOL BUILDINGS AND GROUNDS:

Mr. Kucinski presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Malanga, and unanimously approved by the
Board:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education approves the
requests for the use of school buildings and grounds
(Schedule B), provided they conform to the rules and
regulations set by the Board of Education.

LEAVES OF ABSENCE - Teachers:

Mr. Kucinski presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo. On a roll call vote the reso-
lution was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the following teachers be granted
sabbatical leaves of absence for the 1984/1985 school

year in accordance with procedures established by the

Superintendent of Schools:

Mr. Donald DiGiovine

Miss Helen Poole
Ms., Carol Shepherd

RETIREMENT - Principal: Mr. Ralph D'Andrea

Dr. Baratta presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo, and unanimously approved by
the Board:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the retirement of Mr. Ralph D'Andrea,

Lincoln School principal, be accepted, effective
December 31, 1984.

RETIREMENT - Teacher: Miss Margaret Gerdinick

Dr. Baratta presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Kucinski, and unanimously approved by the
Board:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the retirement of Miss Margéret

Gerdinick, high school French teacher, be accepted
effective July 1, 1984.

RETIREMENT - Teacher: Miss Joan Tomol

Dr. Baratta presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Kucinski, and unanimously approved by the
Board:
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BE IT RESOLVED, That the retirement of Miss Joan Tomol,
high school home economics teacher, be accepted effective
July 1, 1984.

RESIGNATION - Teacher: Mrs. Barbara Kirk

Dr. Baratta presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo, and unanimously approved by
the Board:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the resignation of Mrs. Barbara Kirk,
elementary teacher, be accepted effective May 16, 1984.

RESIGNATION - Transportation: Mr. Edward Reidy

Mr. Malanga presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Kucinski, and unanimously approved by the
Board:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the resignation of Mr. Edward Reidy,
bus driver, be accepted effective April 19, 1984.

APPOINTMENT - Permanent Unassigned Mrs. Angela Abbaleo
Substitute:

Mr. Malanga presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Kucinski. On a roll call vote the resolu-
tion was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That Mrs. Angela Abbaleo be approved as
permanent unassigned substitute for the 1983/1984 school
year, retroactive to April 13, 1984, at the rate of $35.00
per day and fringe benefits which include Blue Cross-Blue
Shield and dental plans.

APPOINTMENTS - Administrative and Supervisory Personnel:

Mr. Malanga presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Kucinski. On a roll call vote the resolu-
tion was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Education that the following
administrative and supervisory personnel be appointed for
the 1984/1985 school year at the classification and step as
indicated, in accordance with the 1984/1985 salary guide:

Name Position Step Salary Longevity
*Frank Votto Principal, Nutley High School 8M $56,019
*Paul Primamore Principal, Franklin School 8M 50, 445 $900

*Alex B. Conrad , Vice Principal, Nutley High School 8M 46,955 700

o
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Name Position Step  Salary Longevity
*John Jacone Vice Principal, Nutley High School 8M $46,955 $700
John F. Drury Admin. Asst., Nutley High School 8M 41,320

William Shergalis Vice Principal, Franklin School 8M 41, 461 900
Ralph D'Andrea Principal, Lincoln School 8M 47,013 900
Rosemarie DiGeronimo Principal, Washington School 8M 47,013 700
H. Evan Powderly Principal, Radcliffe School 8M 47,013

Anthony J. Stivala Principal, Spring Garden School 8M 47,013 700
John Walker Principal, Yantacaw School 8M 47,013 700
*Barbara Hirsch Director of Special Services 8M 49,138

*Paul J. McCarthy Guidance Director, Nutley High &M 41,324

School

*Kathleen Serafino Staff Assistant 8M 44,504

Ronald Barker Department Head &M 37,276 900
Charles Fuccello Department Head 8M 38,200 900
Thomas C. Gallucci Department Head 8M 37,276

Max Kletter Department Head 8M 37,276 900
Joseph Mattiucci Department Head 8M 37,276 900
David Modig Department Head 7 36,096

Loretta Taylor Department Head ™ 34,850 700
Guy Tiene Department Head 8M 37,276 900

*12 month positions

APPOINTMENTS - Intramurals Sponsors:

Mr. Malanga presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta. On a roll call vote the resolu-
tion was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the following teachers supervising in
the intramurals program for the 1983/1984 school year be
approved at the hourly rate of $13.00:

Mr. John Biviano

Mr. Patrick Bobo

Mr. Alex Kaplanovich
Miss Julia Stabile

APPOINTMENTS - Teacher Substitutes:

Mr. Hermo presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo./ On a roll call vote the reso-
lution was unanimously adopted: :

BE IT RESOLVED, That the teacher substitutes listed on

the attached Schedule C be approved for the 1983/1984
school year.

A orto¥
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PAY FOR UNUSED ACCUMULATED SICK DAYS:

Mr. Hermo presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Kucinski. On a roll call vote the reso-
lution was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That Mr. George Schiffert, who has retired

from service, receive pay for 100 unused accumulated sick
days at the rate of $20 per day for a total of $2,000.

EXTRA COMPENSATION - Workshops, Committees:

Mr. Hermo presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Malanga. On a roll call vote the reso-
lution was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the following personnel be paid extra
compensation in the amounts indicated for services performed

in curriculum development:

Computer Curriculum Workshop, April 10, 1984:

Mrs. Rosemary DeRosa $30
Mrs. Nancy Foglio 30
Miss Elizabeth Foote 30
Mr. Stephen Parigi 30
Mrs. Lorraine Restel 30
Miss Rosanna Tangorra 30
Mrs. Jean Tennis 30
Mrs. Mary Wilhelm 30

Total $240

Guidance Committee Meeting, May 12, 1984:

Mr. John Biviano $60
Mr. Mark Blaustein 60
Mrs. Helen Clement . 60
Mr. Joseph Cocchiola 60
Mr. Mario Cocchiola 60
Mrs. Mary Jane Emde 60
Mr. Paul McCarthy 100
Dr. Frank Votto 100
Miss Barbara Hirsch 100
Mr. Paul Primamore 100
Mrs. Margaret Murray 60
Mr. Anthony Stivala 100
Mr. John Walker 100
Miss Judith Winick 60
Mr. Frank Comune 60

Total $1,140
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RATES OF PAY FOR TEMPORARY SUMMER EMPLOYMENT :

Mr. Piro presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta. On a roll call vote the reso-
lution was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education approves
hourly rates of pay for temporary summer custodial/
maintenance/grounds employment and temporary summer
clerical employment as follows:

Step 1 $3.70 per hour
Step 2 $3.95 per hour
Step 3 $4.20 per hour

SUMMER EMPLOYMENT - Grounds:

Mr. Piro presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Kucinski. On a roll call vote the
resolution was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the following be employed as
temporary summer grounds helpers for the summer of
1984, at the hourly rates shown, and effective on
the dates indicated:

Step Hourly Rate Effective Date

Larry Carnovale 2 $3.95 May 14, 1984
Richard Craine 1 $3.70 May 14, 1984
Robert Cymbala 1 $3.70 June 25, 1984
John Redmond 1 $3.70 May 14, 1984

CURRICULUM ADOPTION:

Mr. Piro presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Malanga. On a roll call vote the reso-
lution was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Nutley Board of Education approve

the Computer Education Curriculum for Grades K through 8
as presented at the May 14, 1984 conference session.

TEXTBOOK ADOPTION:

Mr. Battaglia presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo. On a roll call vote the reso-
lution was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education adopt the
Merrill Science Program published by the Charles E.
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Merrill Company for students in Grades One through Six as
presented at the May 7, 1984 conference session.

TEXTBOOK ADOPTION:

Mr. Battaglia presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta. On a roll call vote the resolution
was unanimously adopted: :

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education adopt the
following Social Studies textbooks as presented at the
May 14, 1984 conference session: ~

Grade 5 - Nations of the World
McMillan Publishing Company
Grade 6 - The Country
- Ginn Publishing Company
Grade 7 - History of the American Nation
McMillan Publishing Company
Grade 8 - World Neighbors

McMillan Publishing Company

VOCATIONAL EDUCATION FUNDING - Introduction to Vocations, FY 85:

Mr. Battaglia presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta. On a roll call vote the resolution
was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Nutley Board of Education authorize
submission of application for funds under the provisions of
P.L. 94-482 and/or P.L. 95-207 for the following projects:

Program Area
Line Control

Number Project Title Total Amount

J Introduction to Vocations $9, 761

H 820 Cooperative Indust. Ed. II 4,171
Disadvantaged

H 920 Cooperative Indust. Ed. I § II 2,475

B 221 Marketing and Distributive 6,050
Education

F 201 C.0.E. (Cooperative Office 5,550

Education)
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SUMMER ENRICHMENT PROGRAM:

Mrs. Scheckel presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Kucinski. On a roll call vote the resolu-
tion was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education approves the
Summer Enrichment Program for the summer of 1984, and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the attached budget for the
1984/1985 summer program be adopted. (Schedule D)

GRANT ACCEPTANCE - Public Law 94-142, Part B:

. Mrs. Scheckel presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta. On a roll call vote the resolu-
tion was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the grant allocated by Project
Number FT 715-85, Public Law 94-142, Part B, in the
amount of $63,400, FY 85, be accepted by the Board
of Education.

SPECIAL CLASS PLACEMENT - Atypical Student:

Mrs. Scheckel presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Kucinski. On a roll call vote the resolu-
tion was unanimously adopted:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education authorizes
the attendance of an additional Nutley student at
Special Education classes for the 1983/1984 school
year as follows:

Number of Tuition Per
School Students Classification Student Effective Date
Boystown Emotionally
Kearny, New Jersey 1 Disturbed $8,340 May 4, 1984

CALENDARS :

Mr. Rusignuolo presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Malanga, and unanimously approved by the
Board:

BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education adopts the
following attached calendars for the 1984/1985 school

year:
School Calendar Schedule E
12 Month Calendar Schedule F
Cafeteria Calendar Schedule G

Jﬁfbﬁﬂfﬁ’




BIDS FOR EQUIPMENT FOR THE 1984/1985 SCHOOL YEAR:

Mr. Rusignuolo presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel. On a roll call vote the resolu-
tion was unanimously adopted:

WHEREAS, bids were received on May 17, 1984 at 2:30 p.m.

for the following categories of equipment: Appliances,

Art /Graphics/Mechanical Drawing, Audio-Visual, Auto Shop,
Computer, Furniture, Metals/Woods/Electricity, Music, Office,
Photography and Science, and

WHEREAS, attached as per Schedule H is a list of those
companies that submitted said bids,

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education
hereby authorizes its Secretary to award contracts to the
lowest bidders, provided the items requested meet or are
equal to specifications.

FUEL OIL BIDS:

Mr. Rusignuolo presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mrs. Scheckel. On a roll call vote the resolu-
tion was unanimously adopted:

WHEREAS, the Nutley Board of Education on April 9, 1984,
authorized its Secretary-Business Administrator to enter
into a cooperative bid with Montclair, Bloomfield and
Belleville for the joint purchase of fuel o0il for the
1984/1985 school year, and

WHEREAS, bids were received on May 7, 1984 from the following
bidders:

Dean 0il Corporation
225 LaGrande Avenue
Fanwood, New Jersey

Eastern 0il of New Jersey
1510 Kennedy Blvd.
Jersey City, New Jersey

Lionetti Fuel Company
P.0. Box 890
North Bergen, New Jersey

National Terminal, Inc.
525 Raymond Blvd.
Newark, New Jersey
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J. W. Pierson Oil Company
89 Dodd Street
East Orange, New Jersey

Ultramar Petroleum Inc.
135 Chestnut Ridge Road
Montvale, New Jersey

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, That these bids be recorded in
the minutes as follows:

Posted Bid Total
Bidder Grade . Price Margin Price Service Price
Dean 2 . 8700 +.0187 .8887 No Bid
4 .8150 +.0170 .8320 No Bid
Eastern 2 . 8700 +.0126 .8826 N/C .8826
4 . 8150 -.0115 .8035 N/C . 8035
Lionetti 2 . 8700 +.0353 . 9053 0130 .9183
4 .8150 +.0238 . 8388 .0200 .8588
National 2 . 8700 -.0100 . 8600 .0050 . 8650
4 . 8150 -.0150 .8000 .0025 .8025
Pierson 2 .8700 +.0159 . 8859 .0049 . 8908
4 NO BID
Ultramar 2 NO BID
4 . 8150 +.0156 .8306 No Bid and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the Nutley Board of Education
authorizes the Montclair Board of Education to award, on

its behalf, the bid to National Terminal, Inc. for furnishing
#4 fuel oil and burner service to the Nutley School System
for the 1984/1985 school year in accordance with the
specifications and their low bid thereon.

TESTIMONIAL : Mr. George Schiffert

Mr. Kucinski presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Dr. Baratta, and unanimously approved by the
Board:

WHEREAS, Mr. George Schiffert has tendered his resignation
as teacher in the Nutley Public Schools, effective May 1,
1984, and has signified his intention of retiring from
active service, and

WHEREAS, Mr. Schiffert has worked in the Nutley Public
Schools for a period of thirty-one years, and
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WHEREAS, through the years Mr. Schiffert has exemplified
the finest qualities of the teaching profession at all
times, and

WHEREAS, Mr. Schiffert won the personal friendship of

his fellow teachers and the loyal devotion of every
student who came under the influence of his understanding
and capable teaching,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Education
expresses to Mr. Schiffert its deep appreciation of his
long and faithful service, and extends to him its best
wishes for continued health and happiness, and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That this resolution be made a
part of the minutes of this meeting and a copy presented
to Mr. George Schiffert.

WITHHOLDING OF INCREMENT : I

Mr. Kucinski presented and moved the adoption of the following
resolution, seconded by Mr. Rusignuolo. On a roll call vote the resolu-
tion was unanimously adopted:

WHEREAS, the Superintendent of Schools has recommended
the withholding of [ ' s cnployment and
adjustment increments for the 1984/1985 school year for
unsatisfactory performance of the duties associated with
her position of elementary teacher, and

WHEREAS, the Nutley Board of Education is of the opinion
that there exists good cause for withholding ﬁ's

employment and adjustment increments for the 1984/1985
school year,

BE IT RESOLVED, That [ s enployment and adjust-
ment increments shall be withheld for the 1984/1985 school
year,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the Superintendent of Schools
is hereby authorized to provide [} vith written
notice of the Board's decision and the reasons therefor
within ten days of the date of the resolution.

OLD BUSINESS:

None

NEW BUSINESS:

_ Dr. Fadule stated that with regard to the summer programs, he
would 1ike to add that there is a summer music program run by Mr. Hrbek,
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but that it is not sponsored by the school. Last year there

was a summer computer program. Dr. Fadule added that Nutley
has an English as a Second Language program for those youngsters
who have difficulty with English.

Mr. Malanga stated that he wished to make the Board aware
of his serious concern with regard to the Chestnut Street entrance
and exit from Radcliffe School. He feels that if possible a crossing
guard should be stationed at that driveway for the safety of the
children as the traffic is very heavy at that location. Mr. Restaino
stated that this problem would be discussed in the near future.

Mr. Malanga commented that he had heard many comments con-
cerning the Radcliffe School playground over the past few days, and
wanted to stress that the playground will be improved this summer.

Mr. Rusignuolo made the Board aware of a problem with youngsters
congregating in the rear of the Franklin School and on the playground,
and asked that this problem also be discussed in the near future.

Mr. Malanga questioned if there are plans to recognize the
accomplishments of the youngsters in grades 1 - 8 for their excellent
results regarding the Nutley Achievement Tests, to which Dr. Fadule
replied in the affirmative.

ADJOURNMENT :

There being no further business to come before the Board, on
motion made by Mr. Kucinski, seconded by Mr. Malanga, the meeting was
adjourned at 9:30 p.m. :
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