APP "'DIXD

PROJECT 2835 |[Re-Bid | R BID TABULATION FORM
Nutley School Dist. New Security Entrance @ Nutley H.S e Di Cara | Rubino Architects
DUE DAT|1/20/2016 . L 30 Galesi Drive, Wayne, NJ 07470
TIME:  |10:00AM di cara | rubino [ (973) 256-0202
PLACE: |BOE architects Fax (973) 256-0227
BIDDER
CoOmMmuny
Contractors &| Salazar & D1 Carolis Northeastern
Bullders Assoclates Pal-Pro Assoclates |B. Puntaseccal Fine Wall CR Constr. |Interior
BASE BID $ 387,000.00 | $ 340,000.00 | $ 285,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 260,000.00 NO 8ID
ALT. #1 $ 4,600.00] $ (18,000.00)] $ (8,000.00) NO BID NO BID NO BID $ (10,500.00) NO BID
ALT. #2 $ (3,000.00)] $ (2,000.00)| $ (6,000.00) NO BID NO BID NO BID $ (1,500.00) NO BIiD
ALT #3 NO CHANGE | $ (20,000.00)| $ (38,000.00) NO BID NO BID NO BID $ (70,000.00) NO BID
TOTAL BID W/ ALTERNATES $ 388,600.00 | $ 300,000.00 | $ 233,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 178,000.00 NO BID
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